
 

 
2020 P.130 Amd.(6)Add. 

 

STATES OF JERSEY 

 

GOVERNMENT PLAN 2021–2024 

(P.130/2020): SIXTH AMENDMENT 

(P.130/2020 AMD.(6)) – ADDENDUM 

 

 

Presented to the States on 11th December 2020 

by the Corporate Services Scrutiny Panel 

 

 

 

STATES GREFFE 
  



 

 
Page - 2   

P.130/2020 Amd.(6)Add. 

 

ADDENDUM 

 

If adopted, the sixth amendment to the Government Plan lodged by the Corporate 

Services Scrutiny Panel (P.130/2020 Amd.(6)) would require a consequential 

amendment to the Draft Finance (2021 Budget) (Jersey) Law 202-.  The following is a 

copy of the amendment to the Draft Law that would be so required – 

 

 

DRAFT FINANCE (2021 BUDGET) (JERSEY) LAW 202- (P.147/2020): 

AMENDMENT 

____________ 

1 PAGE 17, ARTICLE 7 – 

For article 7 substitute – 

“7 Article 92B (increase in exemption threshold for child day care) 

amended  

 (1) In Article 92B(1)(c) and (d), for “£16,000” there is substituted 

“£16,320”. 

 (2) In Article 92B(1)(e), for “£6,150” there is substituted “£6,273”. 

 (3) In Article 92B(5), in paragraph (a) of the definition “qualifying 

income”, for “£6,250” there is substituted “£6,300”.”. 

 

 

 

 


